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The Customer, its related bodies corporate and its directors and employees (referred to as “you”) 
acknowledge and agree that they have read and understood the Luxottica Australia Pty Ltd (ACN 58 
054 141 150) (Luxottica, “we”, “us”) Privacy Policy set out below. Luxottica respects your rights to 
privacy under the Privacy Act 1988 (Cth) (Act) and complies with the Act’s requirements.  The terms 
of this statement operate concurrently with any relevant privacy policies of Luxottica’s related bodies 
corporate (as the term is defined in the Corporations Act 2001 (Cth)), save to the extent of any 
inconsistency in which case the terms of this Privacy Policy will prevail. The terms “personal 
information”, “credit information”, “credit eligibility information”, “credit reporting information”, and 
“credit reporting body” have the meaning given to those terms in the Act. For the purposes of this 
Privacy Policy, “information” means “personal information”, “credit information”, “credit reporting 
information”, and “credit eligiblity information”.  
 
Luxottica may collect information about you when you complete a credit application (including but not 
limited to your name, your business and corporate name, address, business references, entity 
details), for the primary purposes of assessing your credit application, reviewing your existing credit 
terms, assessing your credit worthiness, collecting overdue payments, assessing credit guarantees 
(current and prospective), and for our internal administration and business management purposes 
including but not limited to payment processing, archiving, marketing and service development. If 
Luxottica does not collect this information from you, it may restrict or stop your trading with Luxottica, 
extension of credit or continuing to extend credit or extending further credit to you. 
 
Luxottica may disclose information to Luxottica’s employees, related bodies corporate, contractors or 
service providers, past, present or prospective credit providers, and your business references for the 
purposes of operating our business, fulfilling orders made by you, and considering whether to accept 
your offer to act as guarantor or offer security for that credit. You consent to the disclosure of your 
information to overseas recipients, including to Luxottica’s related bodies corporate located in New 
Zealand, United States of America, Italy, and China.  
 
Luxottica may obtain and disclose information for the purposes of obtaining a credit report containing 
information about you, and a report containing information about your commercial and consumer 
credit activities and credit worthiness from a credit reporting body and any financial institutions or 
credit providers named in your credit application or whose names are included in a credit report 
obtained from a credit reporting body about your credit worthiness.  
 
Luxottica may disclose information to a credit reporting body, including but not limited to the fact that 
you have applied for an account, and the amount of credit applied for, details of any payments which 
have become overdue for more than 60 days for which collection action has commenced, any 
cheques that have been written that have been dishonoured more than once, advice that payments 
are no longer overdue and that the credit that has been provided has been discharged. You consent 
to Luxottica’s disclosure of your information to the credit reporting bodies listed below: 
 
Dun & Bradstreet (Australia) Pty Ltd 
Level 24, 201 Elizabeth Street 
Sydney NSW 2000 
 
Ph: 02 8270 2940 
 
Luxottica takes reasonable steps to ensure that your information is held from misuse, loss and 
unauthorised access, modification and disclosure. Your information may be stored in hard copy 
documents and electronically. Luxottica maintains physical and electronic security over the paper and 
electronic data storage, as well as maintaining computer and network security.  
 

If you believe that your privacy has been breached, please contact us using the contact information 

below and provide details of the incident so that we can investigate it. 


